
Retail
Buy & Sell

Telephone: 01633 777000 Email: classified@gwent-wales.co.uk

Can’t find what you’re looking for? Check online at barryanddistrictnews.co.uk

Business

Agriculture

Family Notices

Holiday

Leisure

Motors

Notices

Personal

Property

Retail
Buy & Sell

Expert Services

Recruitment

Address:
Cardiff Road, Maesglas,

Newport. NP20 3QN

Fax: 01633 777121

Latest booking
time, stops and
alterations can

be actioned until
11.30am Tuesday
prior to Thursday

publication.
*Source JICREG/Etelmar April 2015
figure relates to an advert placed for

1 insert in print and 1 week on website.
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Articles For
Sale

Arts, Crafts
& Hobbies

Audio & Hi-Fi

Baby & Nursery
Equipment

Bathrooms

Bedrooms
& Bedding

Bicycles &
Accessories

Books,
Records & CDs

Carpets
& Flooring

Collectables
& Fine Arts

Collectables
& Fine Arts

Curtains
& Blinds

Disabled
Equipment

Cutlery & Crockery

DIY Equipment

Domestic
Appliances

Cutlery & Crockery

For The Home

Furniture &
Furnishings

Garden Tools
& Equipment

Gardening
Accessories

Hairdressing
Equipment

Hobbies &
Pastimes

Household
Furnishings

Jewellery

Ladies Clothes

Lighting
& Lamps

Mens Clothing

Musical
Instruments

Musical
Instruments

Photographic
& Camcorders

Pictures

Printers
& Scanners

Settees
& Suites

Shoes & Bags

Sports
Equipment

Sports
Equipment

Tools

Toys & Games

Toys & Games

TV, Video
& DVD

Wales

ART folder for carrying art
worlk school/college crimson
and blake with carrying pockets
and shoulder strap £10 Tel
01495 740103

DOLLS house tudor style
wooden construction needs
slight attention approx 50yrs
old £50 Tel 01495 740103

EXERCISE machine called a
stepper tried but not used cost
£100 will sell for £60 also bag
of golf clubs £40 Tel 01495
772732

SINGLE wardrobe brown with
half mirror good condition £25
Tel 01633 864008

MANTHORPE gl250 drop down
loft access door white plastic
726 x 553 opening £15 Tel
07769562585

SONY hd dvd recorder/player
excellent condition £30 Tel
02920 306927

WOODEN garden seat needs
tlc £10 Tel 01633 422572

BLUE peep toe shoes ½ heel
worn once matching blue clutch
bag bargain £10 Tel 01495
228318

LADIES wedding outfit size 14
silver knee length l'htener
design excellent condition
dress and jacket bargain £95
Tel 01495 228318

RED electric guitar with stand
speaker and extras plus carry
case exc3ellent condition £75
Tel 07534840618

ROTEL amplifier silver
excellent condition can be
seen working £95 Tel 01633
874392
ROTEL cd player silver
excellent condition can be seen
working £95ono Tel 01633
874392

UMBRO Adult size 10.5
black/white/red astro turf
football boots never worn
absolute bargain £10 Tel:
01446 410652 - Barry area

TRAINERS Immaculate boxed
as new adult size 11 grey/royal
blue The Duffer of St George
high top trainers brought for
£40 sell for bargain price of
£10ono Tel: 01446 410652
Barry Area

KNITMASTER Knitting Machine
+ £45 Tel: 01446 407992 or
07468 577467
PING G25 10.5Degree driver
with head cover good condition
£70ono Tel: 01633 869275

QUADRANT Corner Bath sides
1200mm with side panel. This is
free to the first person who is
willing to collect it Tel: 01495
222887 for further information

SOLID Wooden
entertainment/tv unit excellent
condition 39"L x 17"W x 21"H
bargain £15 Tel: 01446 410652

UNWORN Boxed beautiful
ladies size 7 grey satin Lunar
Elegance court shoes with
matching clutch bag, ideal
mother of the bridge brought for
£75 bargain £45ono Tel: 01446
410652

SET of 16 Dorling Kingsley
Children's illustrated hardback
encyclopaedias as new ideal
school projects/essays bargain
£8 Tel: 01446 410652

GREAT pair brass ceiling lights
ther re on supports welcome
to view tel 01633 852023
bargain £25 £25.00.
01633852023

GIRLS bike in great condition
suit 8 to 14 very yr old cheap at
£20 tel 01633852023

ADJUSTABLE electric bed with
head board no mattress .
excellent condition. £90.00.
07910602333

CHILDS desk and chair made
from solid rubberwood sold by
john lewis ex condition safe
closing hinges to prevent
slamming £25.00.
07941330893

SOLID silver rhona sutton
bracelet lovely item with 15
beads and charms comprising
of 'hope' 'wish' and luck charms
weight 33 grams £59.00.
07941330893

LLADRO nesting crane figurine
1599 In really good condition
no chips or cracks a beautiful
bespoke ornament an
investment cost £89 sell
£30.00. 07941330893

TOM yam rocking chair by qui
qui est paul designer chair is in
really good condition, will
compliment any garden it can
also be used indoors £99.00.
07941330893

SOLID silver charm company
bracelet comes with 7 charms
Inc. cat, horseshoe, star, lock
and key and divider beads
weighs 18 grams approx.
£39.00. 07941330893

GOLDEN labrador dog keel
toys signature puppies brand
new in box comes with tags
attached 120cm in length a real
quality soft toy Ideal xmas
present £29.99. 07941330893

LADIES " verona" british eagle
bicycle lilac 17 ins frame
used twice unused safety
helmet . £30.00. 01633 873089

5 x tins cuprinol anti-slip deck
stain vermont green. 2.5
litres.£12 each 5 for £50 still
packaged. £60.00.
07434299310

KARCHER sc 952 steamer in
good condition 1600 watt ideal
for kitchen and bathroon clean.
£20.00. 07825310508

BOSCH isio mini trimmer with
lithium battery extra blade and
charger .weight 0.6 kg £40.00.
07825310508

BONGO drums new unwanted
gift £35 Tel 01446410314

VACUUM cleaner v good
condition easy to clean and use
can view bargain at £12 tel
01633852023

ELECTROLUX super vac
cleaner turbo excellent
condition ?20 welcome to view
tel 01633852023 £20.00.
01633852023

MENS berghaus jacket size
medium blue as new condition
original cost £250 sell for £20
Tel 01633 892857

TV table black glass will take
video and dvd player very good
condition £20ono Tel
07891694117

HOTPOINT dishwasher slim
line white good condition
£99ono Tel 0781694117

DUNLOP golf clubs new driver
trolley unbrella balls shoes cap
and more £60 Tel
07534840618

BRITAX romer car seat suit
9mth to 4yrs excellent
condition £45 Tel
07928178180

BLUE electric guitar with carry
case plus extras and electronic
tuner and stand excellent
condition £60 Tel
07534840618

3 drawer chest brown 27" high
x 31" wide x 18" fron to back
£20 Tel 01633 864008

SONY lcd tv/hd perfect
condition £50 Tel 01633
612560

HP inkjet printer used very little
almost new £20 Tel 01633
612560

PREMIER quality axminster
wool carpet 12ft x 11ft excellent
condition £55 Tel 01633
612560

3FT bed frame white metal
6mths old as new top quality
£75 Tel 01633 612560

CAR vac cleaner with
accessories operates from 12v
socket in car £6 Tel 01633
612560

TOMY electronic baby monitor
as new in box £6 Tel 01633
612560

ARMITAGE shanks toilet
complete including seat
excellent condition £20 Tel
01633 612560

MIELE 1800w cat and dog
hoover with power plus auto
height adjustment ,swivel
handle £70.00. 07825310508

TWO IKEA floor lamps with foot
switches. brass colored.
£35.00. 01633 400083

FLYMO 14" hover lawn mower
with retract table cable
excellent condition £25 Tel
07840991330

LADIES hush puppies slippers
size 6 navy fur lined slip on
style new boxed cost £28 sell
£10 Tel 01495 246297
LADIES padders slippers size
5 black fur lined slip on style
new boxed £9 Tel 01495
246297

RABBIT hutch very sturdy
never used £20 Tel 01495
220100

WAHL complete hair clipper set
4 cutting lengths scissors,
comb, mains operated with
nose trimmer £12 Tel 02920
793433

BOX set of 6 john wayne cd's
and a box set of 4 jason
statham cds great condition all
10 Tel 02920 793433

CAR and van tow pole will pull
upto 1800kg breaks into 3 parts
with water proof bag £20 Tel
02920 793433

ZULU war original oil painting
of rorkes drift battle framed
20x32 £40 Tel 01495 740103

GOLF clubs 2 woods putter 4
irons bag trolley balls tees
(flagside) made at st andrews
£50 Tel 01495 740103

MINI oven grill toaster 3 heat
settings timer light glass door
easy viewing £10 Tel 01495
224447

FLAT screen tv bag fully
padded rigid front screen
protected 16"h 4"d 20"w 7"
base as new £20 Tel 01495
224447

HAMMA camera tripod
adjustable centre column
telescopic quick rlease legs as
new carry handle bargain £15
Tel 01495 224447

GENTS mountain bike excellent
condition £40 Tel 01495
757434

NATHAN oval dining table with
6 chairs high backed chairs
padded seats good condition
table extends £50ono Tel
01633 874591
MEDIUM oak unit top half has 2
cupboards and 2 glass doors
bottom has 2 drawers and 4
cupboard doors £45ono Tel
016633 874591

PAIR black clarks court shoes
5½ new cost £49.99 sell £8 Tel
01633 874591

SET 4 cushions with covers
fawn/brown bargain £3 Tel
01633 874591

PAIR loafer type shoes fawn
size 6/7 new £3 Tel 01633
874591

2 large brierley crystal vases £5
each or 2 for £8 Tel 01633
874591

BEDROOM chair with storage
space green draylon 6mths old
as new £30 Tel 01495 756470

CREAM leather recliner and
swivel chair matching footstool
as new bargain £95 Tel 01495
756470

3MTRS of cream curtain lining
never used includes 3" tape
heading bargain £10 Tel 01495
756470

BLACK leather managers
swivel chair gas lift seat 47-
57cm high £25 Tel 01495
224447

45" round smoked glass table
with chrome legs and 2 chairs
£40ono Tel 01495 227649
2 teak dining chairs £20ono Tel
01495 227649

CHALLENGE 14.4v twin battery
cordless drill with case full
instructions £15 Tel 01495
224447

LOVELY 3 seater 3 piece suite
slight pattern material cover
mainly cream medium size
excellent condition £100 Tel
07504865065

BOSCH dishwasher silver
good order £50 Tel 01633
760095
FRIDGE freezer ½ and ½ silver
very good condition £60 Tel
01633 760095

SMALL oval breakfast table 2
matching chairs very good
condition £20 Tel 01633
760095

LAWN bowls in excellent
condition suitable for outdoor
or indoor greens genuine
bargain £40 Tel 01446 410314

WASHE /drier servis, drier not
working, good washer. approx
22"" wide. cannot deliver. usk
£10.00. 01929 425984

PRO fitness air cross trainer
originally from argos, just not
being used. £15.00.
01633420320

SCOOTER self assemble,
portable, boxed, never used
10.00. 01633877213

SHIRLEY bassey live on the tv
dvd collectors item, selling for
£25 unopened. £10.00.
01633877213

WEE little piggies game,
electronic nursery rhyme game
£3.00. 01633877213

12 roof tiles surplus to
requirements from extension
type is redland and regent 'm'
£8 Tel 01291 621639

PAVIOR brick for an area of 11ft
x 12ft each os mottled and
sized at
20cm( l ) /10cm(d ) /6cm(h ) .
£60.00. 01291 621639

SHOPPING trolley bag on
wheels lightweight, as new.
£5.00. 01633877213

DEAN ml electric guitar, black,
very good condition, plays
beautifully. £99 + £26
accessories £99.00.
01633877213

BUCKAROO game £3.00.
01633877213
2 x laser tag toy guns game
£10.00. 01633877213

TONY little cross-trainer
"gazelle" very good condition
£40.00. 07936051102

WASHING machine 3 years old
excellent condition £75.00.
07704224660

PLAIN red aisle carpet runner
length: 1,188 cm (39ft) x width:
130 cm (4.3 ft). good as new,
only used once for few hours.
£65.00. 07860650825

BESWICK china large collie
dog excellent condition £39.00.
01246456350

LAWN bowls in excellent
condition genuine bargain £45
Tel 01446 410314

MAXI fly golf clubs full set
brand new complete with bag
and stand graphite shafts on all
drivers £85.00. 441633889423

SET of bowls excellent
condition suitable for outdoor
indoor greens genuine bargain
£45 Tel 01446 410314

BOWLS bags ( 2 ) new large
size sections for bowls, shoes,
clothing, bargain chooice of 2
£25 each 01446 410314

B&Q astral worktop (new) pff
cut size 1520 x 600 x 38 white
£15 Tel 01443 830443

2 wheeled disabled wacker with
storage bag brakes and handle
brakes fully adjustable £18 Tel
07977045950

CARDIFF city football club 80
items shirts, flags scarves,
programmes, photos, badges
old and new style badge
£70ono Tel 01633 853402

MARVEL dc valiant storm image
black comics superman,
spiderman, batman, x-men,
some 1st issues 126 qty very
good condition £60ono Tel
01633 853402

MENS wetsuit new still labelled
wet shoes included size 9 £75
Tel 01495 759104

NEW womens wetsuit size 18
with shoes size 7 never used
still labelled £75 Tel 01495
759104
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Keeping advertising
standards high

OK, so we’re better
at removing bad ads
than making good ones.

The Advertising Standards Authority
Telephone 020 7492 2222 www.asa.org.uk

0845 1999 830
ZoomInLeaflets.co.uk

TRAVEL OFFERS
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Services

@barrydistrict

Follow us

@barrydistrict

Barry DistrictNews&

Blinds & Awnings

Building &
Decorating Fencing & Decking Services

Garden Maintenance

Gardening & Landscaping

Gas Services & Fitters

House Clearance

Painters &
Decorators

Painters &
Decorators

Plumbing & Heating

Waste Disposal

RADS & TAPS
Gas Maintenance & Installation

Energy Efficient Installers.
Combi Boiler Specialists

All plumbing work undertaken.
PENARTH

02920 708 292 141260
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